

6 YONKERS SAT 1 1/4 Mile Pace. ARIA INVITATIONAL PACE. GRADE 2. *\$25,000 GUARANTEED PICK 3 POOL* **\$10,000 SEEDED BY SOA OF NY* ***1 1/4 MILES** Purse \$200,000

\$3 PICK 3 (6-7-8) **\$25,000 GUARANTEED POOL | \$2 EXACTA | \$2 TRIPLE | \$.10 SUPERFACTA**

1 BEST CHIP (L) b h 4, by Heston Blue Chip, Place Your Best by Cambest Last 5 Sts-\$316,300 *1:46.1 M1 26 . 2 1 1 0 \$26,750 26 . 14 8 3 1 *\$370,805
 1:46.1 (L) : 222-100 1:52 VD 7/8 25 YR 0 0 0 0 - 25 Tot 26 4 3 3 \$51,667

6-5 J. Bongiorno 392-71-59-45 (181)						J. Bongiorno 247-46-38-32 (186)						Br. - Winbak Farm,MD						24 YR 0 0 0 0 -Life 52 13 7 6 \$436,459							
5 Sep26	10Wbs	fst ⁶⁴⁺	26	:53	1:194	1:464	CDN DERBY-G1	507600	4	3 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	TiTitrick	JoBongirn	261	264	264	27	1:464	120 +10 5w	L1.65	BstChipPrncHnhOaksdArdn	Tied stakes mark-10
29 Aug26	5Wbs	fst ⁶⁴⁺	254	:542	1:21	1:47	CDN DERBY	36000	4	2 ^{nk}	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	Gave way 2d best-10		254	283	263	262	1:472	119 +11 3w	L1.35	ForOnlrmBstHipCakcsSnmr	
8 Aug26	5M1A	fst ¹⁹⁺	26	:53	1:20	1:46	OPN	40000	7	6 ³⁺	1 ⁹¹	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	JoBongirn	271	261	261	261	1:461	123 +5 4w	L1.40	BstChpCpnHmrFtnHfV	Usp pst 11/12hd handy-8	
4 Aug26	4YR	fst ⁸⁰⁺	27	:561	1:234	1:502	3-6 YO OPN	43000	6	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	Br.Holland	JoBongirn	271	291	273	263	1:502	112 +10 4w	L1.11	BstChpMsDghtHwnhlths	
18 July26	14MSd	fly ⁵⁰⁺	263	:543	1:212	1:482	D-SENDITIN-G3	100000	8	5 ⁰⁵	4 ⁰²⁺	4 ⁰²⁺	4 ⁰²⁺	31	JoBongirn	273	272	264	264	1:483	122	L8.30	LouLihPrncHnwBstChpCn	-8	
11 July26	14MSd	sly	263	:543	1:204	1:464	NW15000	38732	2	32	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	1 ¹³	J.Bongiorn	J.Bongiorn	262	263	274	26	1:464	116 +5 8w	L8.60	BstChpCnHntVhtAndv	Brsh lsd b1/2 handy-8

2	GO GO GRASSHOPPER	b r 4, by Sweet Lou, Faster Faster by Bettor's Delight	Last 5 Sts-\$52,500	1:48.3 M1	26 YR	3	1	2	0	\$43,000	26 Tot	9	4	2	0	\$88,200
				25 YR	0	0	0	0	25 Tot	12	4	3	1	\$92,600		

10-1 Y **Gingras** 628 106 82 80 / 166

[illegible]

3 HOWLENTHEHILLS(L) b g 5, by American Ideal, Arielle Lynn by Somebeachsomewhere Last 5 Sts-\$44,320 1:52.2 PcD 5/8Q 26 YR 15 1 5 6 \$116,730 26 Tot 17 1 6 6 \$131,230
 M & S, Ctr., NY; Fiddlers' Creek, Ctr. & Alexander, B., Ctr., FL; First Sight, Ctr., MI 1:51.2 2 YR 25 YR 15 3 2 5 \$94,890 25 Tot 20 3 4 7 \$179,147

20-1 **Ty Bifer** 664-75-91-95 (113) M Space Sids, NY; Fidler's Creek Sids & Alexander Hq Sids, FL; First Sight Sids, NJ
T. Alexander 601-99-104-97 (165) Br.- Crawford Farms LLC, NY

7 Sep26	3YR	fst ^{75°}	274	:56	1:232	1:504	3:6 YO OPN	43000	3	1 ¹² ₂	1 ¹¹ ₂	1 ¹¹ ₂	1 ^{no} ₂	2 ²³ ₄	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	274	281	272	28	1:512	107	+8 5w	L535	CptMhWnHnthsStringChc	Ld,orkn In hld 2nd-7
31 Aug26	7YR	fst ^{75°}	28	:561	1:241	1:513	3:6 YO OPN	43000	2	2 ¹² ₂	2 ² ₂	3 ¹ ₂	2 ¹ ₂	2 ¹ ₂	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	282	281	274	272	1:514	103	+8 6w	L269	CptMoore Hwnths StringChc	Pkt,2nd ov even-8
22 Aug26	10btv	fst ^{79°}	272	:561	1:233	1:504	KANE PACE	50000	4	2 ¹¹ ₂	2 ¹¹ ₂	2 ¹³ ₂	2 ¹³ ₂	2 ¹³ ₂	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	273	284	273	271	1:511	112		L3.03	CtwistDst Hwnths Congressl	even-8
17 Aug26	6YR	fst ^{78°}	281	:562	1:24	1:513	3:6 YO OPN	43000	4	4 ⁵ ₁	4 ⁶ ₁	3 ² ₁	3 ¹ ₁	3 ³ ₂	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	291	282	263	28	1:521	103	+5 6w	L7.61	GGGrshprBtrbryCityHwnths	Rail,2w bfr 3/4,no bid-6
4 Aug26	4YR	fst ^{80°}	27	:561	1:234	1:502	3:6 YO OPN	43000	4	3 ³ ₃	3 ³ ₃	3 ² ₁	3 ¹ ₁	3 ³ ₂	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	273	291	272	264	1:51	109	+10 4w	L8.18	BestCptMacDnStHwnths	Shole outd,n no bid-6
28 July26	3YR	gd ^{74°}	271	:561	1:243	1:521	3:6 YO OPN	43000	1	3 ³ ₃	3 ³ ₃	2 ¹ ₁	2 ^{hd} ₃	3 ³ ₃	MaKakaley	TrAlexnдр	274	29	28	273	1:522	105	+6 5w	L1:35	McsDnHnGGGrshprHwnths	Sat,2w bfr 3/4,even-6

4	FIFTH AND FIVE (L) 11-10-1 (1) 07-205	br h 4, by Bettor's Delight, Filou Fly Fast by Allamerican Native Pollock Racing LLC/Veneta, Pa.	Last 5 Sts-\$53,846	1:49.1 M1	26 YR	0	0	0	0	- 26 Tot	15	2	1	6	\$109,424
				*1:49 2 Whs 7/8	25 YR	2	0	0	1	\$4,808 25	• 18	7	3	4	\$175,176

15-1 S. Zeron 218-21-32-40 (.096)

22 Sep 26	7Wbs	fst ^{64o}	25z	:53z	1:20z	1:47z	Opn	43200	8	6 ⁵³	4 ^{o3}	4 ^{o3}	5 ³³	6 ⁵	Jamieson	DaMenary	26z	27z	27z	27z	1:48z	112 +10 5w	L8.70	SuglMnFusion	Hunthrlhs		Gd ovr,ired-10	
22 Aug 26	15CDP	fst ^{68o}	27z	:55z	1:22z	1:49z	CUP&SAUC-G3	73000	9	3 ^{1z}	3 ^{1z}	2 ^{1z}	2 ^{1z}	1 ^z	Jamieson	MaMcKinnn	27z	28z	26z	27z	1:50z		L8.35	FtHmFve	Tmsnmysd	SuglMn		Usgl,red-9
15 Aug 26	14CDP	fst ^{68o}	27z	:55z	1:22z	1:50z	CUP & SAUC	10800	7	4 ⁵³	4 ^{4z}	2 ^{o2z}	2hd	3nk	Jamieson	MaMcKinnn	28z	27z	27z	27z	1:49z		L*1.15	HelluvnTmsnmysd	FtHmFve			Usgl pst 1/4,lid,shl,td-r8
8 Aug 26	5M1A	fst ^{79o}	26z	:53z	1:20	1:46z	Opn	40000	6	1 ^{hd}	3 ^{2z}	3 ^{2z}	3 ^{3z}	3 ^{5z}	JaMcclndrl	EnRobinsn	26z	27z	26z	26z	1:47z	116 +5 4w	L8.70	BstCpWprlnmhrd	FtHmFv			2nd ov,lid lane,handy-8
1 Aug 26	1M1*	fst ^{79o}	27z	:55z	1:23z	1:49z	NW15000	22500	7	7 ^{6z}	6 ^{o5}	4 ^{o1z}	3 ^{1z}	1 ^z	SeZeron	EnRobinsn	28z	28z	27z	25z	1:49z	106 +10 6w	L6.40	FtHmFv	Cpnlrnm	CtCsrdr		Ld,ov,handily-5
24 July 26	10M1*	fst	28z	:56z	1:25z	1:51z	Qua		5	1 ^{2z}	1 ^{4z}	1 ⁵	1 ^{4z}	1 ^{2z}	SZeron	ERobinson	28z	28z	28z	26z	1:51z							

5 HEMSWORTH N(L) b g 9, by Sweet Lou, in Hollywood by In The Pocket Last 5 Sts-\$29,490 1:52 YR 28 YR 23 4 2 3 \$77,050 28 Tot 23 4 2 3 \$77,050
71:48 3 (5/8) \$3,350 1362313 Ontario 1 TD Windsor ON, CA 1:50.4 YR 25 YR 31 6 4 3 \$178,920 25 Tot 33 7 4 3 \$186,420

20-1 **J. Stratton** 1105-130-148-152 (.118) **J. Bako** 369-84-68-53(.228) Br.- C J Roberts,NZ 24 YR 32 7 4 6 \$191,330 Life 149 38 16 19 \$741,463

Date	Time	Year	Fst ⁷⁵⁰	2nd ⁷⁵⁰	3rd ⁷⁵⁰	4th ⁷⁵⁰	5th ⁷⁵⁰	6th ⁷⁵⁰	7th ⁷⁵⁰	8th ⁷⁵⁰	9th ⁷⁵⁰	10th ⁷⁵⁰	11th ⁷⁵⁰	12th ⁷⁵⁰	13th ⁷⁵⁰	14th ⁷⁵⁰	15th ⁷⁵⁰	16th ⁷⁵⁰	17th ⁷⁵⁰	18th ⁷⁵⁰	19th ⁷⁵⁰	20th ⁷⁵⁰	21st ⁷⁵⁰	22nd ⁷⁵⁰	23rd ⁷⁵⁰	24th ⁷⁵⁰	25th ⁷⁵⁰	26th ⁷⁵⁰	27th ⁷⁵⁰	28th ⁷⁵⁰	29th ⁷⁵⁰	30th ⁷⁵⁰	31st ⁷⁵⁰	32nd ⁷⁵⁰	33rd ⁷⁵⁰	34th ⁷⁵⁰	35th ⁷⁵⁰	36th ⁷⁵⁰	37th ⁷⁵⁰	38th ⁷⁵⁰	39th ⁷⁵⁰	40th ⁷⁵⁰	41st ⁷⁵⁰	42nd ⁷⁵⁰	43rd ⁷⁵⁰	44th ⁷⁵⁰	45th ⁷⁵⁰	46th ⁷⁵⁰	47th ⁷⁵⁰	48th ⁷⁵⁰	49th ⁷⁵⁰	50th ⁷⁵⁰	51st ⁷⁵⁰	52nd ⁷⁵⁰	53rd ⁷⁵⁰	54th ⁷⁵⁰	55th ⁷⁵⁰	56th ⁷⁵⁰	57th ⁷⁵⁰	58th ⁷⁵⁰	59th ⁷⁵⁰	60th ⁷⁵⁰	61st ⁷⁵⁰	62nd ⁷⁵⁰	63rd ⁷⁵⁰	64th ⁷⁵⁰	65th ⁷⁵⁰	66th ⁷⁵⁰	67th ⁷⁵⁰	68th ⁷⁵⁰	69th ⁷⁵⁰	70th ⁷⁵⁰	71st ⁷⁵⁰	72nd ⁷⁵⁰	73rd ⁷⁵⁰	74th ⁷⁵⁰	75th ⁷⁵⁰	76th ⁷⁵⁰	77th ⁷⁵⁰	78th ⁷⁵⁰	79th ⁷⁵⁰	80th ⁷⁵⁰	81st ⁷⁵⁰	82nd ⁷⁵⁰	83rd ⁷⁵⁰	84th ⁷⁵⁰	85th ⁷⁵⁰	86th ⁷⁵⁰	87th ⁷⁵⁰	88th ⁷⁵⁰	89th ⁷⁵⁰	90th ⁷⁵⁰	91st ⁷⁵⁰	92nd ⁷⁵⁰	93rd ⁷⁵⁰	94th ⁷⁵⁰	95th ⁷⁵⁰	96th ⁷⁵⁰	97th ⁷⁵⁰	98th ⁷⁵⁰	99th ⁷⁵⁰	100th ⁷⁵⁰	101st ⁷⁵⁰	102nd ⁷⁵⁰	103rd ⁷⁵⁰	104th ⁷⁵⁰	105th ⁷⁵⁰	106th ⁷⁵⁰	107th ⁷⁵⁰	108th ⁷⁵⁰	109th ⁷⁵⁰	110th ⁷⁵⁰	111th ⁷⁵⁰	112th ⁷⁵⁰	113th ⁷⁵⁰	114th ⁷⁵⁰	115th ⁷⁵⁰	116th ⁷⁵⁰	117th ⁷⁵⁰	118th ⁷⁵⁰	119th ⁷⁵⁰	120th ⁷⁵⁰	121st ⁷⁵⁰	122nd ⁷⁵⁰	123rd ⁷⁵⁰	124th ⁷⁵⁰	125th ⁷⁵⁰	126th ⁷⁵⁰	127th ⁷⁵⁰	128th ⁷⁵⁰	129th ⁷⁵⁰	130th ⁷⁵⁰	131st ⁷⁵⁰	132nd ⁷⁵⁰	133rd ⁷⁵⁰	134th ⁷⁵⁰	135th ⁷⁵⁰	136th ⁷⁵⁰	137th ⁷⁵⁰	138th ⁷⁵⁰	139th ⁷⁵⁰	140th ⁷⁵⁰	141st ⁷⁵⁰	142nd ⁷⁵⁰	143rd ⁷⁵⁰	144th ⁷⁵⁰	145th ⁷⁵⁰	146th ⁷⁵⁰	147th ⁷⁵⁰	148th ⁷⁵⁰	149th ⁷⁵⁰	150th ⁷⁵⁰	151st ⁷⁵⁰	152nd ⁷⁵⁰	153rd ⁷⁵⁰	154th ⁷⁵⁰	155th ⁷⁵⁰	156th ⁷⁵⁰	157th ⁷⁵⁰	158th ⁷⁵⁰	159th ⁷⁵⁰	160th ⁷⁵⁰	161st ⁷⁵⁰	162nd ⁷⁵⁰	163rd ⁷⁵⁰	164th ⁷⁵⁰	165th ⁷⁵⁰	166th ⁷⁵⁰	167th ⁷⁵⁰	168th ⁷⁵⁰	169th ⁷⁵⁰	170th ⁷⁵⁰	171st ⁷⁵⁰	172nd ⁷⁵⁰	173rd ⁷⁵⁰	174th ⁷⁵⁰	175th ⁷⁵⁰	176th ⁷⁵⁰	177th ⁷⁵⁰	178th ⁷⁵⁰	179th ⁷⁵⁰	180th ⁷⁵⁰	181st ⁷⁵⁰	182nd ⁷⁵⁰	183rd ⁷⁵⁰	184th ⁷⁵⁰	185th ⁷⁵⁰	186th ⁷⁵⁰	187th ⁷⁵⁰	188th ⁷⁵⁰	189th ⁷⁵⁰	190th ⁷⁵⁰	191st ⁷⁵⁰	192nd ⁷⁵⁰	193rd ⁷⁵⁰	194th ⁷⁵⁰	195th ⁷⁵⁰	196th ⁷⁵⁰	197th ⁷⁵⁰	198th ⁷⁵⁰	199th ⁷⁵⁰	200th ⁷⁵⁰	201st ⁷⁵⁰	202nd ⁷⁵⁰	203rd ⁷⁵⁰	204th ⁷⁵⁰	205th ⁷⁵⁰	206th ⁷⁵⁰	207th ⁷⁵⁰	208th ⁷⁵⁰	209th ⁷⁵⁰	210th ⁷⁵⁰	211st ⁷⁵⁰	212nd ⁷⁵⁰	213rd ⁷⁵⁰	214th ⁷⁵⁰	215th ⁷⁵⁰	216th ⁷⁵⁰	217th ⁷⁵⁰	218th ⁷⁵⁰	219th ⁷⁵⁰	220th ⁷⁵⁰	221st ⁷⁵⁰	222nd ⁷⁵⁰	223rd ⁷⁵⁰	224th ⁷⁵⁰	225th ⁷⁵⁰	226th ⁷⁵⁰	227th ⁷⁵⁰	228th ⁷⁵⁰	229th ⁷⁵⁰	230th ⁷⁵⁰	231st ⁷⁵⁰	232nd ⁷⁵⁰	233rd ⁷⁵⁰	234th ⁷⁵⁰	235th ⁷⁵⁰	236th ⁷⁵⁰	237th ⁷⁵⁰	238th ⁷⁵⁰	239th ⁷⁵⁰	240th ⁷⁵⁰	241st ⁷⁵⁰	242nd ⁷⁵⁰	243rd ⁷⁵⁰	244th ⁷⁵⁰	245th ⁷⁵⁰	246th ⁷⁵
------	------	------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	--------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	---------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	----------------------	---------------------

COACHES CORNER(L) b g b y Always A Virgin; Carobbean Pacey by Somebeachsomewhere Last 5 Sts-\$33,820
41:49.3 \$14,418 Jeff Fought Racing, East Bernstadt KY; Brian K Carsey, Cambridge City, IN

#-1 J. Bartlett	902-277-121 (307)	Pe. Engblom 67-14-14-5 (209)								Br.-Black Creek Farm & Hickory Hollow Stables,IN								24 YR 10 Wks \$423.40 Life 106 26 21 15 \$1,000.00								
5 Sep26	5Wbs	fst ^{64*}	26	:53	1:194	1:464	CDN DERBY-G1	507600	10	10 ¹²	10 ¹⁴	10 ^{9 9 1}	10 ⁸	74 ¹	JaBartitt	PtEngblm	282	272	254	26	1:473	117	+10 5w	L79.15	BestChicPrncHnhv OakwdArdn	Belated-10
29 Aug26	10Wbs	fst ^{64*}	26	:54	1:21	1:47	CDN DERBY	36000	3	3 ^{1 1}	3 ^{1 1}	3 ^{1 1}	3 ^{2 1}	34 ¹	JaBartitt	PtEngblm	26	263	26	1:473	116	+11 3w	L15.05	ForOnclrm BestChic CochsCmr	Saved.best rest-9	
22 Aug26	14PCdCA	fst ^{74*}	26	:55	1:22	1:484	FFA-G3	100000	5	4 ^{3 3}	4 ^{3 3}	3 ^{1 1}	3 ^{1 1}	43	JaBartitt	PtEngblm	273	283	261	263	1:491	111	+7 3w	L7.00	ForOnclrm SmeHlnd Dandyldel	Tokunc.tiring-8
22 Aug26	13M1	fst ^{74*}	26	:54	1:214	1:483	D-MckeeMemG2	139900	2	7 ^{9 3}	9 ^{8 1}	7 ^{9 4}	6 ^{4 1}	6 ^{2 3}	TiTitreick	PtEngblm	274	272	267	263	1:491	106	+5 4w	L17.80	CptnAlbnPrncHnhvBythmls	Took bk chd ovsty-on-8
27 July26	4YR	fst ^{78*}	27	:56	1:234	1:512	Ive	43000	6	11 ¹	11 ¹	11 ¹	11 ¹	11 ¹	JaBartitt	PtEngblm	273	283	273	273	1:512	107	+8 5w	L1.40	GorgsBgGly CeltSprc	Ld won safely-6
11 Feb77	fst ^{70*}	27	:56	1:23	1:53	RWDVHeds G2	\$35300	0	1 ^{3 3}	1 ^{3 3}	1 ^{1 1}	1 ^{1 1}	12 ¹	JaBartitt	PtEngblm	27	203	27	273	0	127	+6 5 w	L1.40	LoudHlmsr CrtGalsUlysses	Plat 14 Lsd Hns avng 9-8	

7	SWEET PEACH LIFE (L)	b.g. 5 by Sweet Low Life la A Beach by Somebeachsomewhere	1:50.1 YR	26 *	16	10	3	2	\$98,250	26 *	17	10	3	2	\$91,400
---	-----------------------------	---	-----------	------	----	----	---	---	----------	------	----	----	---	---	----------

7	SWEET BEACH LIFE(L)	by S. J. Sweet Ltd., Life Is A Beach by Somebeachsomewhere	Last 5 Sts-\$107,500	1:50.1 1YR	25 YR 15 6 4 1	\$114,880 25 Tot	19 6 5 1	\$123,097
31:49.3 (5/8)	\$17,141	A Sweet Beach Life Stable, Pleasant Valley, N.Y.	1:51.1 YR	24 24 1 1 0	\$127,750 15	64 22 42 7		

8-5 Ma. Kakaley 787-101-124-121 (.128) T. Alexander 601-99-104-97(.165) Br.- Sergeant Stables LLC,PA 24 . 5 2 1 0 \$127,750 Life 64 23 12 7 \$500,000

24 Aug'26	4YR	fst ^{10*}	27:	56:	1:23:	1:12:	Inf	43000	8	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1-2	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	27:	28:	28:	27:	1:31:	107	+8 w	L+1.03	SwBchlLeCphnrmHd CphnrmHd	Ld, won handily?
24 Aug'26	6YR	fst ^{75*}	27:	56:	1:23:	1:12:	Inf	43000	7	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1-2	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	27:	29:	27:	1:50:	110	+5 sw	L+1.42	SwBchlLeCphnrmHd MacsDght	Ld, won handily?	
10 Aug'26	4YR	fst ^{82*}	26:	56:	1:24:	1:12:	Inf	43000	5	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1-1	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	26:	29:	28:	27:	1:51:	107	+9 sw	L+1.21	SwBchlShFrstBrnCy	Used pst 1/4 Ld handy-
3 Aug'26	4YR	fst ^{78*}	27:	56:	1:23:	1:50:	Inf	43000	6	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1 ¹	1-3	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	27:	28:	27:	26:	1:50:	113	+5 w	L*20	SwBchlLeChtSprtGorgsBggy	Only leaver handy-
20 July'26	9YR	fst ^{90*}	26:	54:	1:23:	1:12:	Inf	43000	7	7 ⁹	7 ⁸	5 ⁰ :	4:	1nk	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	28:	28:	27:	27:	1:51:	107	+5 sw	L+1.38	SwBchlLeShFrstInMsdlbn	Trail crv fan out drng?7
13 Aug'26	8YR	fst ^{1*}	27:	56:	1:24:	1:50:	Inf	43000	6	1 ¹	1 ²	1 ¹	1 ¹	1nk	Makakaleye	TrAlxndr	27:	29:	28:	26:	1:50:	110	+8 w	L+0.06	SwBchlLeMosdeBenShFrstne	Ld dug in safely-

61:51 Q \$5,132	Flatland Racing, Campbell Hall, NY	1:51.2 YR	25 YR 30 10 8 3	\$200,750 25 Tot 33 10 9 3	\$202,965
62:15 YR \$3,000	Flatland Racing, Campbell Hall, NY	24 YR 0 0 0 0	- life	74 16 18 7	\$343,423

R. Bucci 388-66-52-50(.093) Br.-Mrs D E Smith & C M Smith,NZ
1 Sep 26 2VB fst73° 28 -554 1:23 1:51 NW15000 23000 2 211 211 211 211 211
BdHolland R.Bucci 381 274 271 274 1:51 **107** 1:5 5w **I * 90 AveAveCnSOnOffTheSHmsIN** Pkt and lstr tndyB

[illegible]

9	CAPTINHAMMERHEAD A(L)	b h 7, by Captaintreacherous, Rogers Passion by Art Major	Last 5 Sts-\$37,860	1:48.4 PcD 5/8	26 YR	7	2	1	2	\$56,510	26 Tot	13	3	2	2	\$85,991
				None in U.S.A.	25 YR	0	0	0	0	-	25 Tot	18	4	1	1	\$54,806

71-48.4 (5/8) Q \$6,615	Chad Kowal, Cuddesbackville, NY	None in U.S.A.	25 YR 0 0 0 0	- 25 YR 0 0 0 0	\$2,100
15-1 P. Dunn 26-2-6-7 (.077)	S. Blackler 112-16-11-20 (.143)	Br.- Roger Bazley Synd AS	24 YR 0 0 0 0	- Life 61 18 6 6	\$311,383

31 Aug/26	8YR	fst ^{75°}	272	:554	1:233	1:512	Inv	43000	4	4 ⁴	3 ⁰ 1 ²	2 ⁰ 1	2 ¹ 1	8 ¹ 1 ²	GeBrennan	ScBlacklr	281	272	281	282	1:521	108	+8 6w	L4:37	SwBchlLrBtrCnpCpCnAlbn	2w, 1st up, grind, ind-7
24 Aug/26	4YR	fst ^{75°}	267	:56	1:234	1:504	Inv	43000	3	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	JaBartitt	ScBlacklr	271	29	274	27	1:51	107	+5 5w	L4:50	SwBchlLrCpCnrmhdMacDlght	Pk ang, in, ind-7
8 Aug/26	5M1	fst ^{75°}	263	:536	1:20	1:461	Opn	40000	5	4 ¹ 1 ³	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	DeDunn	ScBlacklr	27	264	262	262	1:463	118	+5 4w	L2:16	BstCpCnrmhmfdrPntFv	Usd pnt 1/4, id, even-8
25 July/26	10PcD	fst ^{82°}	253	:532	1:202	1:48	wc25000t	29500	4	1 ¹ 1 ¹	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	2 ¹ 1	4 ¹ 1	MaKakaley	ScBlacklr	253	28	27	274	1:482	112	+5 4w	L7:40	RutHshHmv KentHrv Congress	Yld, pkit, bring-6
18 July/26	10PcD	gr ^{74°}	254	:54	1:21	1:484	wc25000t	29500	3	6 ⁵	7 ⁰ 4 ¹	5 ⁰ 1 ¹ 2	3 ¹ 1 ¹	1 ¹	GnPlntrHr	ScBlacklr	268	28	262	273	1:484	114	+4 2v	L5:90	Cnprlmrhd Congress	Wide, all-out-8
11 July/26	10PcD	fst ^{84°}	254	:53	1:20	1:472	wc25000t	27500	2	4 ³	3 ²	3 ²	4 ² 3	BrBckwth	ScBlacklr	263	271	263	273	1:484	116	+8 6w	L5:70	DanydlHd RutHshHmv GoltHrv	Unc, chas, trd-8	

10	MOSSDALE BEN N(L)	br g 8, by A Rocknroll Dance, Mossdale Sue by Bettor's Delight	Last 5 Sts-\$21,500	1:48.4 Nfd	26 YR 18 5 5 1	\$215,750	26 Tot 20 6 6 1	\$365,750
				1:51.1 YR	25 19 9 2 2	\$454,080	25 21 9 2 3	\$480,080

12:1 J. Marohn, Jr. 788-109-86-66 (138)	P. Tritton 110-20-17-15(182)	Br. A G Affleck, NZ	24 YR 0 0 0 0 -Life 84 23 18 8 .9955,819
---	-------------------------------	---------------------	--

24 Aug26	4YR	fst ⁷⁵	27	:56	1:234	1:504	Inv	43000	6	4 ¹ ₁	4 ⁴	4 ³ ₁	4 ³	5 ³ ₄	4 ^{nk}	JimMarhnJr	PeTritton	274	29	273	271	1:513	105	+5	5w	L9.03	SwBchlLcPphnmhdMcsDght	2nd ov ang h no bid-7
17 Aug26	4YR	fst ⁷⁸	264	:553	1:23	1:512	Inv	43000	2	2 ² ₁	2 ²	3 ¹ ₂	3iprg ¹ ₁	4 ^{nk}		JimMarhnJr	PeTritton	271	284	271	281	1:512	105	+5	6w	L*64	McsDghtChaseHmShFrstn	Pkt,steppy ln,pace-6
10 Aug26	4YR	fst ⁸²					Inv	43000																				
3 Aug26	4YR	fst ⁷⁸	271	:56	1:232	1:501	Inv	43000	5	6 ³ ₃	6 ⁸ ₁	4 ⁴ ₁	4 ⁵ ₁	6 ⁵ ₁	4 ^{nk}	JimMarhnJr	PeTritton	283	29	263	27	1:511	108	+5	6w	L*12	SwBchlLcCltcSprGrsgsBgGy	No spd,1st up,no bid-6
20 July26	9YR	fst ⁸⁰	262	:543	1:231	1:512	Inv	43000	6	1 ^{no} _{no}	2 ² ₃	1 ¹ ₁	2 ¹ ₁	3 ³ ₃		JimMarhnJr	PeTritton	262	282	282	284	1:502	113	+5	3w	L1.64	SwBchlLcShFrstnMsdIbn	2w rail,sp 34,gm 3rd-7
13 July26	8YR	fst ⁹¹	27	:561	1:241	1:504	Inv	43000	5	2 ¹ ₁	2 ² ₃	2 ¹ ₁	3 ² ₂	2 ^{nk}		JimMarhnJr	PeTritton	271	292	274	262	1:504	108	+8	4w	L*80	SwBchlLcMsdleBenShFrstne	Pkt,ang ln,pace-6

UNCOUPLED ENTRIES PER NYCRR 4111.15. (L) TREATED WITH LASIX -NOS. 9,10 START FROM 2ND TIER

1	SOUTHWIND COORS(L) 3:12(7/8) \$6,166 12-1 Y. Gingras 638-106-92-89 (166) 4 Sep26 3M ¹ fst ⁸⁵⁰ 28 :56:2 1:24:3 1:51:3 Qua 29 Aug26 4M ¹ fst ⁸⁵⁰ 28 :57:1 1:25:4 1:53:3 Qua 13 Aug26 10YR fst ⁸¹⁰ 28 :57:2 1:25:4 1:54 Inv 6 Aug26 4YR fst ⁸⁷⁰ 29 :58:1 1:26:1 1:54:2 NW3035L5 13 Jul26 8PcD fst ⁸⁴⁰ 27 :55:2 1:22:4 1:54 nw20600L5 30 Jun26 10PcD fst ⁸⁸⁰ 27 :56:3 1:25:1 1:52:2 mw17500L5	b g 6, by Walner, Southwind Cabaret by Muscle Hill Burke Rco Stb.Frdroktm.PA>Weaver Bruscmi.Cnsbro.PAP Collura.Mrntn Tp.PA R. Burke 376-66-63-53(.176) 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 3 3 ⁴ ₁ 3 ² ₁ 3 ² ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 3 ⁴ ₃ 4 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 5 ⁶ ₃ 1 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁ 2 ¹ ₁
----------	---	--

NO. 3 DEVILISH HILL - FIRST TIME LASIX (L) TREATED WITH LASIX -NOS. 9,10 START FROM 2ND TIER

